
Non-financial Highlights

Countries and regions with  
overseas offices

21
The SBI Group has established over-
seas offices, primarily in the growth 
markets of emerging countries in Asia, 
and is pursuing global business expan-
sion in various fields.

(As of March 31, 2017)

countries and  
regions

Number of Group  
companies

223companies

The SBI Group consists of 223 compa-
nies, of which 187 are consolidated 
subsidiaries, and 36 are equity method 
associates.

(As of March 31, 2017)

Number of  
Group employees

4,455persons

The SBI Group has grown from 55 
persons at establishment to 4,455 
persons, owing to dramatic business 
development.

(As of March 31, 2017)

Ratio of  
female managers

Percentage of overseas assets 
under management

15.4 %

65%

The SBI Group continues to stress 
diversity in employment. The current 
ratio of female managers is 15.4%.

The Group is establishing a global 
investment structure in cooperation with 
overseas local partners, striving to tran-
sition “from Japan’s SBI to the World’s 
SBI.”

(As of March 31, 2017)

(As of March 31, 2017)

Number and percentage of  
independent outside executives

Number of  
5-ALA-related patents

5persons/23.8%

SBI Holdings has appointed five Inde-
pendent Outside Executives, accounting 
for 23.8% of total of 21 Directors and 
Statutory Auditors

5-ALA-related patents held by SBI 
Pharmaceuticals number 41 in Japan, 
of which 26 are also held overseas.

(As of June 30, 2017)

(As of March 31, 2017)

The Group’s  
customer base

Cumulative donations made by the 
SBI Children’s Hope Foundation

SBI SECURITIES, SBI Sumishin Net 
Bank, SBI Insurance and others con-
tinue to steadily increase the number of 
customers, and the Group customer 
base continues to expand.

Through the SBI Children’s Hope Foun-
dation, the SBI Group actively pursues 
solutions to child welfare problems for 
the sake of children. The Foundation 
has made cumulative donations of 
approximately ¥990 million, to the fiscal 
year ended March 31, 2017.

(As of March 31, 2017)

21.79million

Approx.¥990million41patents
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